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Lecturer or Assistant Teaching Professor of Cybersecurity

The School of Business Administration at Penn State Harrisburgis seeking qualified applicants for 
a Lecturer or Assistant Teaching Professor of Cybersecurity (non-tenure line) to begin January 2025 or 
August 2025. The successful candidate will combine a strong background in cybersecurity and network 
security with a commitment to innovative teaching and student success. We are seeking an 
enthusiastic and dedicated individual who shares our commitment to teaching, research, and service. 
The successful candidate will also contribute to our efforts to create a welcoming and inclusive learning 
environment for students and engage in scholarly and service activities supporting institutional goals. 
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The School of Business Administration is AACSB accredited. For more information about the 
technology programs at the business school please visit our website at 
http://harrisburg.psu.edu/business-administration. This position is a term position and has a strong 
likelihood of renewal.

Responsibilities:The primary responsibilities of the Lecturer or Assistant Teaching Professor of 
Cybersecurity include:

Teaching: Specific job responsibilities include teaching undergraduate courses in cybersecurity, 
security, and risk analysis. These courses are taught in-person and synchronously. Primary teaching 
areas include the following: digital networking and network security, cybersecurity and cyber forensics, 
security and malware analytics, and risk management. Secondary teaching areas could include the 
following: static and dynamic malware analysis, cyber defensive techniques, cybersecurity-related 
machine learning, programming skills (Java & Python), and database technology.

Research/Scholarship: Faculty are expected to maintain a high level of professional activity through 
scholarship and service.

Service:All faculty are expected to undertake committee work, advising, community engagement, and 
mentorship, and make other contributions to the campus, to DEIB goals and initiatives, and to the 
broader academic community.

Qualifications: Preferred candidates will hold a doctorate in cybersecurity, Information Technology, or 
a related field with specialization in cybersecurity and network security. Candidates with a master's 
degree in cybersecurity, Information Technology or a related field and possess security-related 
certifications (CISSP, CISM, CEH, OSCP, CCNA, etc.) are strongly encouraged to apply. In order to 
start at the rank of Assistant Teaching Professor (as opposed to Lecturer), the successful candidate 
must receive their doctorate degree prior to appointment. 

DEIB Requirement: Candidates should demonstrate a commitment to transforming teaching methods, 
communication approaches, course materials, learning objectives, and learning environments to 
genuinely support, respect, and cater to the diverse needs of student populations at Penn State 
Harrisburg.

Application Process: Review of applications will begin immediately and continue until the position is 
filled. Applicants should expect to upload a cover letter, curriculum vitae, a statement of teaching 
philosophy, and contact information for three references to hr.psu.edu/careers. 
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Select "Browse Positions" under "Academic & Faculty"

Locations: Penn State Harrisburg

Job Category: Academic Group

For additional questions, please contact: Andrew Morrow (amorrow@psu.edu)

The Pennsylvania State University is committed to and accountable for advancing diversity, equity, 
inclusion, and sustainability in all of its forms. We embrace individual uniqueness, foster a culture of 
inclusion that supports both broad and specific diversity initiatives, leverage the educational and 
institutional benefits of diversity in society and nature, and engage all individuals to help them thrive. 
We value inclusion as a core strength and an essential element of our public service mission. Likewise, 
the School of Business is committed to attracting and retaining a diverse workforce. We believe 
diversity benefits and enriches students, staff, and faculty within our school. We are dedicated to 
building and sustaining an equitable, inclusive, and welcoming teaching and learning environment 
where cultural diversity is valued and celebrated.

Penn State Harrisburg is a campus of the Pennsylvania State University, the Commonwealth of 
Pennsylvania's land -grant institution, serving more than 85,000 students. Penn State Harrisburg, the 
Capital College, enrolls 4,600 students in residential instruction and an additional 1,000 students in 
programs delivered online via the University's World Campus. Penn State Harrisburg offers two 
associate, 35 baccalaureate, 25 Master's, and three doctoral degrees. The college also offers the first 
two years of study leading to more than 275 baccalaureate majors available throughout Penn State. 
Additionally, the campus participates in nine online degree offerings (six graduate and three 
undergraduate) through Penn State World Campus, and offers accelerated undergraduate/graduate 
programs, joint degrees in collaboration with Penn State Dickinson Law and the Penn State College of 
Medicine, and continuing education opportunities.

Apply online at https://psu.wd1.myworkdayjobs.com/PSU_Academic/job/Penn-State-
Harrisburg/Lecturer-or-Assistant-Teaching-Professor-of-Cybersecurity_REQ_0000059832-1

CAMPUS SECURITY CRIME STATISTICS: For more about safety at Penn State, and to review the 
Annual Security Report which contains information about crime statistics and other safety and security 
matters, please go to http://www.police.psu.edu/clery/, which will also provide you with detail on how to 
request a hard copy of the Annual Security Report.

Penn State is an equal opportunity, affirmative action employer, and is committed to providing 
employment opportunities to all qualified applicants without regard to race, color, religion, age, sex, 
sexual orientation, gender identity, national origin, disability or protected veteran status.
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Contact Information

Please reference Academickeys in your cover letter when
applying for or inquiring about this job announcement.

Contact
N/A

Pennsylvania State University
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